
ITEM SCHOOL ADDRESS QUANTITY UNIT PRICE
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY 609 Church, Anthony, NM 88021 3
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY 455 Shrode Road, Anthony, NM 88021 2
3 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 800 County Line Drive, Chaparral, NM 88081 10
4 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 290 E. Lisa Drive, Chaparral, NM 88081 2
5 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 5235 Highway 28, Anthony, NM 88021 2
6 DESERT TRAIL  ELEM 310 E. Lisa Drive, Chaparral, NM 88081 1
7 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY 1105 Valle Vista, Sunland Park, NM 88063 1
8 GAC/GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 4950 McNutt Rd, Sunland Park NM 88063 1
9 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 6301 Highway 28, Anthony, NM 88021 8

10 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY 1451 Donaldson Street, Anthony, NM 88021 1
11 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY 300 Cascade Ave., San Miguel, nm 88058 3
12 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 100 Airport Road, Santa Teresa, NM 88008 5
13 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY 580 Angeline Blvd., Chaparral, NM 88081 1

TOTAL 40

Bid Content Sheet- Inspection and Service of Fire Sprinklers Systems --Quarterly Inspections                                                                           
Include mileage rate per mile and fuel charges in rates



Purchasing Agent:  GEORGINA GALVAN Phone Number:  575-882-6252
Bid Number: 18-19-13 Opening Date: NOVEMBER 6, 2018

Witness:

Item Description Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY 3 -$             NO BID 170.00$   510.00$     -$          -$               
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY 2 -$             NO BID 170.00$   340.00$     -$          -$               
3 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 10 -$             NO BID 170.00$   1,700.00$  -$          -$               
4 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 2 -$             NO BID 170.00$   340.00$     -$          -$               
5 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 2 -$             NO BID 170.00$   340.00$     -$          -$               
6 DESERT TRAIL  ELEM 1 -$             NO BID 170.00$   170.00$     -$          -$               
7 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY 1 -$             NO BID 170.00$   170.00$     -$          -$               
8 GAC/GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 1 -$             NO BID 170.00$   170.00$     -$          -$               
9 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 8 -$             NO BID 170.00$   1,360.00$  -$          -$               

10 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY 1 -$             NO BID 170.00$   170.00$     -$          -$               
11 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY 3 -$             NO BID 170.00$   510.00$     -$          -$               
12 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 5 -$             NO BID 170.00$   850.00$     -$          -$               
13 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY 1 -$             NO BID 170.00$   170.00$     -$          -$               

40 -$                                       6,800.00$  -$               

Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.        (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable             (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Department:  PHYSICAL PLANT 
Advertising Date:  OCTOBER 4, 2018

Description:  QUARTERLY INSPECTION AND SERVICE OF FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS Time:  2:00 PM

DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER

ASSURANCE FIRE PROTECTION, LLC  DIMAR SYSTEMS, LLC 

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS
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