
SCHOOL ADDRESS QUANITIY UNIT PRICE 
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 600 FOURTH STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 6
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 92 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 6
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 3
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 800 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 6
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 290 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 6
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 100 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 310 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 4
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1105 VALLE VISTA, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 4
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 4950 MCNUTT, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 4

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1440 HIGHWAY 478, ANTHONY, NM 88021 6
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 6301 HIGHWAY 28, ANTHONY, NM 88021 22
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1301 W. WASHINGTON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 6
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 875 MERCHANTILE AVENUE, LA UNION, NM 88021 4
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1451 DONALDSON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 4
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 205 NM HWY 228, MESQUITE, NM 88048 4
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 CASCADE AVE., SAN MIGUEL, NM 88058 4
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 1325 W. WASHINGTON, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4085 MCNUTT ROAD, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 4
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 4800 MCNUTT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 6
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 201 COMMERCIANTE BLVD., SANTA TERESA,NM 88008 6
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 100 AIRPORT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 13
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 305 ALTO VISTA DRIVE, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 4
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1000 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 6
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 330 HOLGUIN ROAD, VADO, NM 88072 5
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 580 ANGELINE BLVD., CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 6

TOTAL 139

BID CONTENT SHEET - INSPECTION AND SERVICE OF RANGE HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS--FUSE LINKS

SEMI ANNUAL
ATTACHMENT A 

INCLUDE MILEAGE RATE PER MILE AND FUEL COST IN PRICING



SCHOOL ADDRESS QUANITIY UNIT PRICE 
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 600 FOURTH STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 92 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 800 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 2
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 290 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 100 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 310 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1105 VALLE VISTA, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 4950 MCNUTT, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1440 HIGHWAY 478, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 6301 HIGHWAY 28, ANTHONY, NM 88021 2
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1301 W. WASHINGTON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 875 MERCHANTILE AVENUE, LA UNION, NM 88021 1
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1451 DONALDSON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 205 NM HWY 228, MESQUITE, NM 88048 1
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 CASCADE AVE., SAN MIGUEL, NM 88058 1
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 1325 W. WASHINGTON, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4085 MCNUTT ROAD, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 4800 MCNUTT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 201 COMMERCIANTE BLVD., SANTA TERESA,NM 88008 1
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 100 AIRPORT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 3
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 305 ALTO VISTA DRIVE, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1000 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 330 HOLGUIN ROAD, VADO, NM 88072 1
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 580 ANGELINE BLVD., CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1

TOTAL 27

BID CONTENT SHEET - INSPECTION AND SERVICE OF RANGE HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEM--HOOD VENTILATION

SEMI ANNUAL
ATTACHMENT A 

INCLUDE MILEAGE RATE PER MILE AND FUEL COST IN PRICING



SCHOOL ADDRESS QUANITIY UNIT PRICE 
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 600 FOURTH STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 92 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 800 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 0
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 290 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 100 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 310 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 0
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1105 VALLE VISTA, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 4950 MCNUTT, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1440 HIGHWAY 478, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 6301 HIGHWAY 28, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1301 W. WASHINGTON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 875 MERCHANTILE AVENUE, LA UNION, NM 88021 1
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1451 DONALDSON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 205 NM HWY 228, MESQUITE, NM 88048 0
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 CASCADE AVE., SAN MIGUEL, NM 88058 1
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 1325 W. WASHINGTON, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4085 MCNUTT ROAD, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 4800 MCNUTT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 201 COMMERCIANTE BLVD., SANTA TERESA,NM 88008 1
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 100 AIRPORT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 305 ALTO VISTA DRIVE, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1000 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 330 HOLGUIN ROAD, VADO, NM 88072 1
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 580 ANGELINE BLVD., CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1

TOTAL 19

BID CONTENT SHEET - INSPECTION AND SERVICE OF RANGE HOOD SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS - SLAVE CYLINDER
INCLUDE MILEAGE RATE PER MILE AND FUEL COST IN PRICING

ATTACHMENT A 
SEMI ANNUAL



SCHOOL ADDRESS QUANITIY UNIT PRICE 
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 600 FOURTH STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 92 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 800 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 2
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 290 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 100 SHRODE ROAD, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 310 E. LISA DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1105 VALLE VISTA, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 4950 MCNUTT, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1440 HIGHWAY 478, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 6301 HIGHWAY 28, ANTHONY, NM 88021 2
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1301 W. WASHINGTON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 875 MERCHANTILE AVENUE, LA UNION, NM 88021 1
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1451 DONALDSON STREET, ANTHONY, NM 88021 1
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 205 NM HWY 228, MESQUITE, NM 88048 1
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 300 CASCADE AVE., SAN MIGUEL, NM 88058 1
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 1325 W. WASHINGTON, ANTHONY, NM 88021 0
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4085 MCNUTT ROAD, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 4800 MCNUTT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 1
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 201 COMMERCIANTE BLVD., SANTA TERESA,NM 88008 1
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 100 AIRPORT ROAD, SANTA TERESA, NM 88008 3
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 305 ALTO VISTA DRIVE, SUNLAND PARK, NM 88063 1
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1000 COUNTY LINE DRIVE, CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 330 HOLGUIN ROAD, VADO, NM 88072 1
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 580 ANGELINE BLVD., CHAPARRAL, NM 88081 1

TOTAL 27

BID CONTENT SHEET - INSPECTION AND SERVICE OF RANGE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS - HOOD SYSTEM

SEMI ANNUAL
ATTACHMENT A 

INCLUDE MILEAGE RATE PER MILE AND FUEL COST IN PRICING



5

Purchasing Agent:  GEORGINA GALVAN Phone Number:  575-882-6252
Bid Number: 18-19-14 Opening Date: NOVEMBER 6, 2018

Witness:

Item Description Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 3 9.75$       29.25$                                   
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 0 9.75$       -$                                       
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 22 9.75$       214.50$                                
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 0 9.75$       -$                                       
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 13 9.75$       126.75$                                
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 4 9.75$       39.00$                                   
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 5 9.75$       48.75$                                   
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 6 9.75$       58.50$                                   

139 1,355.25$                             -$         
TERMS
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER

ASSURANCE FIRE PROTECTION, LLC

TOTAL PRICE

Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.        (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable             (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing
Department:  PHYSICAL PLANT 
Advertising Date:  OCTOBER 4, 2018

Description:  Semi Annual Inspection & Service of Range Hood Suppression Systems--Fuse Links Time:  2:00 PM



6

Purchasing Agent:  GEORGINA GALVAN Phone Number:  575-882-6252
Bid Number: 18-19-14 Opening Date: NOVEMBER 6, 2018

Witness:

Item Description Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 2 NO BID 
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 0 NO BID 
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 1 NO BID 

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 2 NO BID 
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 0 NO BID 
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 3 NO BID 
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 NO BID 

27 -$                                        -$         -$                               
TERMS
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER

ASSURANCE FIRE PROTECTION, LLC

TOTAL PRICE

Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.        (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable             (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing
Department:  PHYSICAL PLANT 
Advertising Date:  OCTOBER 4, 2018

Description:  Semi Annual Inspection & Service of Range Hood Suppression Systems--Hood Ventilation Time:  2:00 PM



7

Purchasing Agent:  GEORGINA GALVAN Phone Number:  575-882-6252
Bid Number: 18-19-14 Opening Date: NOVEMBER 6, 2018

Witness:

Item Description Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 0 -$         -$                                           
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 0 -$         -$                                           
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 0 -$         -$                                           
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 0 -$         -$                                           
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 0 -$         -$                                           
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 0 20.00$     -$                                           
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 20.00$     20.00$                                      

19 380.00$                                    -$         -$                  
TERMS
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER

ASSURANCE FIRE PROTECTION, LLC

TOTAL PRICE

Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.        (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable             (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing
Department:  PHYSICAL PLANT 
Advertising Date:  OCTOBER 4, 2018

Description:  Semi Annual Inspection & Service of Range Hood Suppression Systems--Slave Cylinder Time:  2:00 PM



8

Purchasing Agent:  GEORGINA GALVAN Phone Number:  575-882-6252
Bid Number: 18-19-14 Opening Date: NOVEMBER 6, 2018

Witness:

Item Description Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 ANTHONY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
2 BERINO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
3 CHAPARRAL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
4 CHAPARRAL HIGH SCHOOL 2 60.00$     120.00$                                  
5 CHAPARRAL MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
6 DESERT PRIDE ACADEMY 0 -$         -$                                        
7 DESERT TRAIL ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
8 DESERT VIEW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
9 GADSDEN ADMINISTRATIVE COMPLEX 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    

10 GADSDEN ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
11 GADSDEN HIGH SCHOOL 2 60.00$     120.00$                                  
12 GADSDEN MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
13 LA UNION ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
14 LOMA LINDA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
15 MESQUITE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
16 NORTH VALLEY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
17 PHYSICAL PLANT COMPLEX 0 -$         -$                                        
18 RIVERSIDE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
21 SANTA  TERESA MIDDLE SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
19 SANTA TERESA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
20 SANTA TERESA HIGH SCHOOL 3 60.00$     180.00$                                  
22 SUNLAND PARK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
23 SUNRISE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
24 VADO ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    
25 YUCCA HEIGHTS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL 1 65.00$     65.00$                                    

27 1,720.00$                              -$         -$               

DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER

ASSURANCE FIRE PROTECTION, LLC

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS

Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable     (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing
Department:  PHYSICAL PLANT 
Advertising Date:  OCTOBER 4, 2018

Description:  Semi Annual Inspection & Service of Range Hood Suppression Systems--Hood System Time:  2:00 PM
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