
GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa - Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 2008 Time: 2:00
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - Chaparral Middle School Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Washington Music Mesilla Valley Pro Music White's Music Box Capshaw Olivas
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#Buffet E-11 Wooden Clarinet 2 769.00 1,538.00 899.00 1,798.00 661.00 1,322.00 749.50 1,499.00
2 Item# YF221 Yamaha Flute 2 345.00 690.00 416.40 832.80 254.00 508.00 359.50 719.00
3 Item# YEP 201 Yamaha Euphonium 2 1,166.00 2,332.00 1,418.40 2,836.80 1,454.00 2,908.00 1,542.50 3,085.00
4 Item# CBB4714 Cerveny BBb JR tuba 1 2,699.00 2,699.00 no bid 1,872.00 1,872.00 no bid
5 LP Aspire Bongos 1 97.00 97.00 69.66 69.66 no bid 79.50 79.50
6 Bongo Stand 1 64.00 64.00 59.95 269.00 no bid 67.50 67.50
7 LP Aspire Congas 10" and 11" 1 247.00 247.00 269.00 no bid no bid 336.50 336.50
8 Concert Tambourine 10" double row 1 169.00 169.00 no bid no bid no bid
9 TreeWorks Double Row Multi Tree 1 179.00 179.00 149.00 149.00 no bid no bid

10 Hi Hat Stand 1 79.00 79.00 70.95 70.95 no bid no bid
11 Paiste 14" Hi Hat 1 197.00 197.00 99.00 99.00 no bid no bid
12 Concert Cymbal Stand (ST176) 1 94.00 94.00 no bid no bid no bid
13 Pearl Suspended Cymbal Stand 1 79.00 79.00 no bid no bid no bid
14 Pearl Concert Toms 13" and 14" 1 325.00 325.00 no bid no bid no bid
15 Ludwig Percussion Learning Center 1 259.00 259.00 no bid no bid no bid
16 Ludwig Trap Table 1 99.00 99.00 99.00 no bid no bid

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS N30
DELIVERY 30-90 days
FOB Destination
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER 46R06 18R67

low bid
low bid w/in-state preference
lowest qualified bidder per band director



GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa - Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 2008 Time: 2:00
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - Chaparral Middle School Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Natl Educ Music Bertie's Music
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#Buffet E-11 Wooden Clarinet 2 685.00 1,370.00 919.13 1,838.26
2 Item# YF221 Yamaha Flute 2 343.00 686.00 no bid
3 Item# YEP 201 Yamaha Euphonium 2 1,133.00 2,266.00 no bid
4 Item# CBB4714 Cerveny BBb JR tuba 1 2,429.00 2,429.00 no bid
5 LP Aspire Bongos 1 no bid 77.04 77.04
6 Bongo Stand 1 no bid 71.00 71.00
7 LP Aspire Congas 10" and 11" 1 no bid 276.46 276.46
8 Concert Tambourine 10" double row 1 no bid no bid
9 TreeWorks Double Row Multi Tree 1 no bid 283.75 283.75

10 Hi Hat Stand 1 no bid 78.60 78.60
11 Paiste 14" Hi Hat 1 no bid 270.00 270.00
12 Concert Cymbal Stand (ST176) 1 no bid 75.28 75.28
13 Pearl Suspended Cymbal Stand 1 no bid 90.66 90.66
14 Pearl Concert Toms 13" and 14" 1 no bid no bid
15 Ludwig Percussion Learning Center 1 no bid no bid
16 Ludwig Trap Table 1 no bid no bid

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS N30
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER

low bid
lowest qualified bid per band director
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