
GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa - Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 2008 Time: 2:00
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - Gadsden High School Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Washington Music Mesilla Valley Pro Music White's Music Box Capshaw Olivas
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#YFL461H Yamaha Flutes 2 1,015.00 2,030.00 1,233.60 2,467.20 1,066.00 2,132.00 1,085.00 2,170.00
2 Item# Fox IV Bassoon 1 3,923.00 3,923.00 no bid 2,972.00 2,972.00 4,136.75 4,136.75
3 Item# CS840 Yamaha Cymbal Stand 1 69.00 69.00 58.95 58.95 83.00 83.00 no bid
4 Item# CS945 Yamaha Boom Cymbal 2 84.00 168.00 72.00 144.00 92.00 184.00 no bid
5 Item#CS925 Yamaha Boom w/weight sta 1 99.00 99.00 82.00 82.00 95.00 95.00 no bid
6 Item#HS1100 Yamaha HI Hat Stand 1 129.00 129.00 129.00 129.00 85.00 85.00 no bid
7 Item#DS1100 Yamaha Drum Throne 1 177.00 177.00 169.00 169.00 142.00 142.00 no bid
8 Item#KB962 Hamilton Saxophone stan 2 34.00 68.00 25.00 50.00 36.00 72.00 29.95 59.90
9 Item#KB570 Hamilton Bari Saxophone 1 59.00 59.00 66.95 66.95 72.00 72.00 66.00 66.00

10 Item#YEP321 Yamaha Baritones 2 1,589.00 3,178.00 1,899.00 3,798.00 1,754.00 3,508.00 1,628.50 3,257.00
11 Item#3047 AF Getzen Tenor Trombone 2 2,250.00 4,500.00 133.95 267.90 1,954.00 3,908.00 2,076.00 4,152.00
12 Silent Brass system for Trumpet 2 115.00 230.00 116.95 233.90 no bid 121.50 243.00
13 Silent Brass System for French Horn 2 142.00 284.00 139.95 279.90 136.00 272.00 148.50 297.00
14 Silent Brass System for Trombone 2 133.00 266.00 133.95 267.90 no bid 139.50 279.00
15 Silent Brass System forTuba 2 269.00 538.00 329.95 659.90 no bid 343.50 687.00
16 Silent Brass System for Euphonium 2 169.00 338.00 164.95 329.90 no bid 165.00 330.00

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS N30
DELIVERY 30-90 days
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER 46R06 18R67

low bid
low bid w/in-state preference
lowest qualified bidder per director
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Washington Music Sales Mesilla Valley Music White's Music Box Capshaw Olivas
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

17 Item#YM2300 DC Yamaha Marimba 1 3,768.00 3,768.00 69.95 69.95 3,518.00 3,518.00 3,549.50 3,549.50
18 Item#M169 Musser Marimba M300 1 4,658.00 4,658.00 no bid 3,336.00 3,336.00 no bid
19 Item#PO771 One pair Zildjian Cymbal 1 15.95 15.95 26.00 26.00 no bid 19.50 19.50
20 Item#LP450 Lp Bell Tree w/stand 1 206.00 206.00 169.95 169.95 no bid 197.50 197.50
21 Item#WB8 8" Grover Woodblock 1 40.00 40.00 no bid no bid no bid
22 Item#WB10 10" Grover Woodblock 1 42.00 42.00 no bid no bid no bid
23 Item#LP243 Lp Super Guiro 1 34.00 34.00 29.50 29.50 no bid 36.00 36.00
24 Item#LP209 LP Deluxe Vibraslap 1 32.00 32.00 31.00 31.00 no bid 37.50 37.50
25 Item#LP15 LP Flex-A-Tone Stand 1 19.50 19.50 19.95 19.95 no bid 22.50 22.50
26 Item#LP18 LP Flex-A-Tone Large 1 29.00 29.00 26.95 26.95 no bid 31.95 31.95
27 Item#TH147NP Siren Whistle 1 26.00 26.00 no bid no bid 37.40 37.40
28 Item#302 American Slide Whistle 1 19.00 19.00 no bid no bid 14.95 14.95
29 Item#TH534 Train Locomotive Whistl 1 5.00 5.00 no bid no bid 69.50 69.50
30 Item#M245 Matador strap lock bongo 1 69.00 69.00 86.95 86.95 no bid 78.95 78.95
31 TREzen Tre works Zen Tree Chimes 1 147.00 147.00 no bid no bid no bid
32 Item#DB-90 boss Dr Beat-90 Metronom 1 139.00 139.00 149.95 149.95 no bid 159.00 159.00
33 Item#PGA-32 Pearl Long Hexa Ganza 1 15.00 15.00 no bid no bid 18.75 18.75
34 Item#LP262R LP Rosewood claves 1 12.00 12.00 13.95 13.95 no bid 12.50 12.50
35 Item#LP333 LP Pro Scraper 1 12.00 12.00 11.95 11.95 no bid no bid
36 Item#XLMHH Pearl XL Marching 4 40.00 160.00 no bid no bid no bid
37 Item#DC5642216BD (RG) Protechtor 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid



GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa - Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 2008 Time: 2:00
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - Gadsden High School Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Natl Educ Music Bertie's Music
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#YFL461H Yamaha Flutes 2 1,116.00 2,232.00 no bid
2 Item# Fox IV Bassoon 1 3,886.00 3,886.00 no bid
3 Item# CS840 Yamaha Cymbal Stand 1 no bid no bid
4 Item# CS945 Yamaha Boom Cymbal 2 no bid no bid
5 Item#CS925 Yamaha Boom w/weight sta 1 no bid no bid
6 Item#HS1100 Yamaha HI Hat Stand 1 no bid no bid
7 Item#DS1100 Yamaha Drum Throne 1 no bid no bid
8 Item#KB962 Hamilton Saxophone stan 2 no bid 41.77 83.54
9 Item#KB570 Hamilton Bari Saxophone 1 no bid 41.77 41.77

10 Item#YEP321 Yamaha Baritones 2 1,548.00 3,096.00 no bid
11 Item#3047 AF Getzen Tenor Trombone 2 no bid no bid
12 Silent Brass system for Trumpet 2 99.35 198.70 no bid
13 Silent Brass System for French Horn 2 121.00 242.00 no bid
14 Silent Brass System for Trombone 2 113.42 226.84 no bid
15 Silent Brass System forTuba 2 277.00 554.00 no bid
16 Silent Brass System for Euphonium 2 140.00 280.00 no bid

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS N30
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER
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Natl Educ Music Bertie's Music
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

17 Item#YM2300 DC Yamaha Marimba 1 2,970.00 2,970.00 no bid
18 Item#M169 Musser Marimba M300 1 2,970.00 2,970.00 no bid
19 Item#PO771 One pair Zildjian Cymbal 1 no bid 15.60 15.60
20 Item#LP450 Lp Bell Tree w/stand 1 no bid no bid
21 Item#WB8 8" Grover Woodblock 1 no bid no bid
22 Item#WB10 10" Grover Woodblock 1 no bid no bid
23 Item#LP243 Lp Super Guiro 1 no bid 39.58 39.58
24 Item#LP209 LP Deluxe Vibraslap 1 no bid 38.75 38.75
25 Item#LP15 LP Flex-A-Tone Stand 1 no bid 24.75 24.75
26 Item#LP18 LP Flex-A-Tone Large 1 no bid 35.75 35.75
27 Item#TH147NP Siren Whistle 1 no bid 35.03 35.03
28 Item#302 American Slide Whistle 1 no bid 12.25 12.25
29 Item#TH534 Train Locomotive Whistl 1 no bid 63.25 63.25
30 Item#M245 Matador strap lock bongo 1 no bid no bid
31 TREzen Tre works Zen Tree Chimes 1 no bid 149.20 149.20
32 Item#DB-90 boss Dr Beat-90 Metronom 1 no bid 138.31 138.31
33 Item#PGA-32 Pearl Long Hexa Ganza 1 no bid no bid
34 Item#LP262R LP Rosewood claves 1 no bid 13.80 13.80
35 Item#LP333 LP Pro Scraper 1 no bid no bid
36 Item#XLMHH Pearl XL Marching 4 no bid no bid
37 Item#DC5642216BD (RG) Protechtor 1 no bid no bid

No award for 18 - want dust cover, not instrum
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