
GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 08 Time: 2:00 pm
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - STHS Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Washington Music Mesilla Valley Pro Whites Music Box Capshaw Olivas
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#YHR-668ND French Horns 4 2,578.00 10,312.00 3,259.00 13,036.00 2,718.00 10,872.00 2,786.50 11,146.00
2 Item#RMTV HQS Yamaha Drums Carrie 2 129.00 258.00 150.00 300.00 180.00 360.00 125.00 250.00
3 Item#RMTVHS Yamaha Snare Drum 6 129.00 774.00 150.00 900.00 141.00 846.00 125.00 750.00
4 Item#RMTVMB Yamaha Bass Drum 6 129.00 774.00 150.00 900.00 132.00 792.00 125.00 750.00
5 Yamaha Field Master Drum cs#DA9014 6 94.00 564.00 99.00 594.00 72.00 432.00 89.50 537.00
6 Yamaha Field Master Drum #DA80045 2 189.00 378.00 189.00 378.00 168.00 336.00 168.00 336.00
7 Bass Drum cs #DA4018 1 89.00 89.00 95.00 95.00 89.00 89.00 84.00 84.00
8 Bass Drum cs #DA4020 1 97.00 97.00 109.00 109.00 109.00 109.00 95.00 95.00
9 Bass Drum cs #DA4022 1 109.00 109.00 129.00 129.00 121.00 121.00 112.00 112.00

10 Bass Drum cs #DA4024 1 123.00 123.00 139.00 139.00 126.00 126.00 129.00 129.00
11 Bass Drum cs #DA4026 1 127.00 127.00 149.00 149.00 131.00 131.00 134.00 134.00
12 Bass Drum cs #DA4028 1 169.00 169.00 159.00 159.00 136.00 136.00 140.00 140.00

TOTAL PRICE 13,774.00 16,888.00 14,350.00 14,463.00
TERMS N30
DELIVERY 30-90 days
FOB destination
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER 46R06 18R67

low bid
lowest qualified bidder per band director



GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 08 Time: 2:00 pm
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - STHS Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Natl Educ Music Bertie's Music
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#YHR-668ND French Horns 4 2,399.00 9,596.00 no bid
2 Item#RMTV HQS Yamaha Drums Carrie 2 234.00 468.00 no bid
3 Item#RMTVHS Yamaha Snare Drum 6 234.00 1,404.00 no bid
4 Item#RMTVMB Yamaha Bass Drum 6 209.00 1,254.00 no bid
5 Yamaha Field Master Drum cs#DA9014 6 87.00 522.00 no bid
6 Yamaha Field Master Drum #DA80045 2 255.00 510.00 no bid
7 Bass Drum cs #DA4018 1 84.00 84.00 no bid
8 Bass Drum cs #DA4020 1 93.00 93.00 no bid
9 Bass Drum cs #DA4022 1 106.50 106.50 no bid

10 Bass Drum cs #DA4024 1 120.00 120.00 no bid
11 Bass Drum cs #DA4026 1 120.00 120.00 no bid
12 Bass Drum cs #DA4028 1 232.00 232.00 no bid

TOTAL PRICE 14,509.50
TERMS
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER
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