
GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 2008 Time: 2:00 pm
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - STMS Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Washington Music Mesilla Valley Pro Whites Music Box Capshaw Olivas
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#7242 Leblanc Clarinets 6 299.00 1,794.00 399.00 2,394.00 336.00 2,016.00 329.50 1,977.00
2 Item#2SP Gemeinhardt Flutes 2 239.00 478.00 425.00 850.00 254.00 508.00 274.50 549.00
3 Item# Yamaha Tuba student model 3/4 1 2,639.00 2,639.00 3,190.00 3,190.00 2,772.00 2,772.00 3,141.85 3,141.85
4 LP Fiberglass Congas 11" and 12 1/4" 2 249.00 498.00 279.00 558.00 no bid 319.50 639.00
5 Item#PBE3618-210997 Bass Drum Pearl 1 749.00 749.00 no bid 654.00 654.00 637.00 637.00
6 Getzen Fluglehorn 1 829.00 829.00 795.00 795.00 842.00 842.00 833.00 833.00

TOTAL PRICE 6,987.00 7,776.85
TERMS N30
DELIVERY 30-90 days
FOB destination
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER 46R06 18R67



GISD Purchasing Office Bid Tabulation Sheet
Note:  (1) Control Agent initial here:         if low bid is acceptable.  (2) Attach memo stating why low bid is not acceptable  (3) Return your recommendation to Purchasing

Purchasing Agent: Mr. Hinojosa Fine Arts Department Box No.: Phone Number: 882-6731
Bid Number: 07-08-30 Advertising Date: December 19, 2007 Opening Date: January 14, 08 Time: 2:00 pm
Description: Musical Instruments for Secondary Schools - STMS Results Sent:
Purchasing Agent: Witness:

Natl Educ Music Bertie's Music
Item Description Qty Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Item#7242 Leblanc Clarinets 6 245.00 1,470.00 no bid
2 Item#2SP Gemeinhardt Flutes 2 212.00 424.00 no bid
3 Item# Yamaha Tuba student model 3/4 1 1,713.00 1,713.00 no bid
4 LP Fiberglass Congas 11" and 12 1/4" 2 no bid 310.00 310.00
5 Item#PBE3618-210997 Bass Drum Pear 1 722.00 722.00 no bid
6 Getzen Fluglehorn 1 749.00 749.00 no bid

TOTAL PRICE
TERMS
DELIVERY
FOB
IN-STATE PREFERENCE NUMBER
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